

Michael R. Buonaguro Barrister and Solicitor

2461 Bloor Street West
Suite #4
Toronto, Ontario M6S 1P7

Ph: (416) 767-1666

Fax: (416) 767-2229

Utilities Consumers' Group

April 27, 2007

Attention:

File #: 05-171
Inv #: 73

RE: YUB Review of YEC/MINTO PPA (Phase 2 of 20 Year Resource Plan Review)

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Feb-14-07	Review of letter to YUB, redraft, review of relief requested.	1.00	170.00	MRB
Feb-21-07	Review of PPA.	1.00	170.00	MRB
Feb-22-07	Review of PPA.	1.00	170.00	MRB
Feb-23-07	Review of PPA and related documents.	3.00	510.00	MRB
	Review of PPA and related documents, review of IRs.	1.50	255.00	MRB
Feb-25-07	Draft IR's.	2.50	425.00	MRB
Feb-26-07	Finalize IR's and file.	1.00	170.00	MRB
Feb-28-07	Review of IR's, PPA Material.	0.50	85.00	MRB
Mar-05-07	Review IR's, file with YUB.	0.40	68.00	MRB
Mar-07-07	Review of application material re: argument	2.00	340.00	MRB

	preparation.			
Mar-08-07	Review of application material in preparation for argument, email to PM, R.R.	1.50	255.00	MRB
Mar-09-07	Review of IR answers from YEC, emails to/from R.R., PM re argument.	3.00	510.00	MRB
Mar-12-07	Review of draft letter to board, email drafts and comments to client and consultant.	1.00	170.00	MRB
Mar-13-07	Preparation of argument for PPA review.	2.00	340.00	MRB
Mar-14-07	Review of YEC submissions, emails from PM, email to PM, client, email from YUB, YCS submissions.	0.40	68.00	MRB
	Drafting argument re PPA.	2.00	340.00	MRB
Mar-15-07	Review email correspondence, email to PM, Email to Percival.	0.50	85.00	MRB
Mar-20-07	Review of correspondence to YUB re Percival Motion.	0.40	68.00	MRB
	Review case law re confidentiality of documents.	1.00	170.00	MRB
Mar-21-07	Draft response to YEC comments on UCG motion.	2.50	425.00	MRB
Mar-25-07	Review correspondence from UCG, email to client.	0.30	51.00	MRB
Mar-31-07	Correspondence to client re Percival submission.	0.50	85.00	MRB
Apr-02-07	Review statute, email to client.	0.30	51.00	MRB
	Reviewing drafts from PM, R.R., incorporating into one draft, edit and distribute new draft.	2.50	425.00	MRB
	Phone to client, letter to Board.	0.40	68.00	MRB
Apr-03-07	Review of correspondence from client. Call to consultant.	0.20	34.00	MRB

	Conference with consultant.	0.50	85.00	MRB
Apr-04-07	Drafting submissions re PPA.	2.50	425.00	MRB
	Finalize submissions.	0.50	85.00	MRB
Apr-05-07	Review of YEC, YECL, PPA submissions.	1.50	255.00	MRB
Apr-10-07	Finalize and file reply submissions.	2.50	425.00	MRB
	Totals	39.90	<u>\$6,783.00</u>	
	Total GST on Fees		406.98	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			<u>\$7,189.98</u>

TAX ID Number 830059879

Total GST \$406.98