

## Deana Lemke

---

**From:** The Percivals [percivals@northwestel.net]  
**Sent:** June 22, 2007 11:38 AM  
**To:** Deana Lemke  
**Subject:** Re: Cost Applications to the YUB

**Attachments:** YUB PPA COSTS.xls



YUB PPA COSTS.xls  
(31 KB)

Good morning Deana:

I hope the attached detailed cost invoice sheets are what you and the YUB require. These do not exactly match the YUB's summaries that I submitted earlier as I found I had left some minor things out of the original submission please feel free to readjust the YUB summary sheets I previously sent to conform with this more detailed and accurate assessment.

Regards: Peter W. Percival, P. Eng.

Deana Lemke wrote:

> Hello Peter:

>

> The Board is requesting a breakdown of the costs pertaining to your  
> cost application (attached). Please provide this breakdown at your  
> earliest convenience but by no later than the close of business  
> tomorrow, Friday, June 22.

>

> If you have any questions, please let me know.

>

> Deana Lemke

>

> -----Original Message-----

> From: The Percivals [mailto:percivals@northwestel.net]

> Sent: May 31, 2007 8:01 PM

> To: Deana Lemke

> Cc: 'Wayne Tuck'; mike@datapathsystems.net; 'Doug Tenney'; 'Gary

> McRobb'; 'Hector Campbell'; 'James Grattan'; 'John Landry'; 'John

> Maissan'; 'Josee Bonhomme'; 'Lawrie Crawford'; 'Lewis Rifkind';

> 'Loyola Keough'; 'Malchow, Cynthia'; 'Michael Buonaguro'; 'Mona

> Pollitt-Smith'; 'Paul Kishchuk'; Roger Rondeau; Samson Hartland;

> 'Sharon Schmitz'; 'Shelley Dixon'; 'Val Mather'; 'Renee Marx'; 'Dwayne Ward'

> Subject: Re: Cost Applications to the YUB

>

> Good evening Ms Lemke,

>

> Attached is my cost claim respecting the time and effort I put into  
> the Yukon Utilities Board's (YUB) review of Yukon Energy Corporation's  
> (YEC) 20 Year Resource Plan (20 YRP) primarily as this review related  
> to the Power Purchase Agreement between YEC and its prospective  
> customer Minto Copper.

>

> While I did not participate at the opening hearing into the 20 YRP  
> last November, I did participate in the workshop / pre-hearing  
> conference in July 2006 and attended the resumption of the hearing  
> last month. I read and reread all the YEC 20YRP application with  
> particular regard to all the issues surrounding the PPA and the  
> proposal to install a third turbine at the Aishihik power facility.

>

> I contend that I provided substantial, significant and effective input

> to the review process.  
>  
>  
> The attached cost claim has been compiled from my email logs and  
> diary notes.  
>  
> \*I affirm, that to the best of my knowledge and belief, the hours and  
> disbursements claimed are a true and fair representation of the time I  
> expended on this hearing process. In fact, if anything, I have likely  
> understated the time and efforts expended.  
>  
>  
> \*Respectively submitted,  
>  
> Peter W. Percival, P. Eng.  
>  
>>  
>>  
>>  
>>  
>>  
>  
>

**PWP's COST CLAIM - YEC 20 YR. RESOURCE PLAN AS RELATED TO PPA, AISHIK #3 & CSTP**

Item	Date	Description	Invoice Time	Fee Rate	Travel Dist. Rate
1	June 06	Read / review YEC 20 yr. Resource Plan (Tab2 CSTP & Aishik #3)	2.5	\$125	\$313
2	Jun. 06	Review & assess Ministers Letter to YUB of June 5, 2006	0.3	\$125	\$38
3	Jun 25, 06	Attend Pre-hearing Conference = 4 hours	4	\$125	\$500
					<b>\$850.00</b>
4	Jun 25, 06	Travel Cowley - Whitehorse Return to attend pre-hearing conference	76	\$0.55	\$41.80

**PWP's COST CLAIM - RELATED TO THE PPA, CSTP & AISHIK # 3**

Item	Date	Description	Invoice Time	Fee Rate	Travel Dist. Rate
1	Dec 27, 06	Read/review YEC PPA Term Sheet, email & attachments from YUB Research & prepare comments / responses to the YEC PPA Term Sheet, Communications with other intervenors, read UCG, YCS & City's submissions	2	\$125	\$250
2	Jan 3-4, 07	City's submissions	8	\$125	\$750
3	Jan 8, 07	Read / review & digest YEC Reply Argument re PPA Term Sheet	0.5	\$125	\$63
4	Jan 15 -16	Read / review YUB Report to Minister on YEC 20 yr Resource Plan	1.5	\$125	\$188
5	Feb 8 - 22	Read/review/analyze YEC PPA Approval Application Documents & discuss with other intervenors: YECL, UCG, YCS	6	\$125	\$750
6	Feb 10	Read / review YUB Order 2007-01	0.25	\$125	\$31
7	Feb 14	Review of YEC 20 yr Resource Plan Hearing Cost Sheets	0.35	\$125	\$44
8	Feb 15	Read / review UCG (MB) letter to YUB re Board Order 2007-01	0.1	\$125	\$13
9	Feb 16	Read / assess YECL (Bennett Jones) Intervenor Application letter	0.15	\$125	\$19
10	Feb 19-20	Read / review & assess UCG (RR) IRs	2	\$125	\$250
11	Feb 21	Read / review YUB letter to UCG & YECL	0.2	\$125	\$25
12	Feb 23	Read & assess YCS IRs	0.3	\$125	\$38
13	Feb 23	Read & assess YUB IRs	1.25	\$125	\$156
14	Feb 26	Prepare PWP IRs,	2	\$125	\$250
15	Feb 27	Read & assess UCG IRs (MB)	1.5	\$125	\$188
16	Feb 27-28	Read & assess YECL IRs	1.75	\$125	\$219
17	Feb 28	Read UCG (MB) letter to YUB	0.1	\$125	\$13
18	Mar 5	Read & assess UCG IRs (MB)	0.75	\$125	\$94
19	Mar 5	Prepare PWP IRs, second round	0.15	\$125	\$19
20	Mar 5	Read /review & assess YUB letter re: second round of IRs	0.2	\$125	\$25
21	Mar 6	Prepare PWP IRs, second round, with email inquiry to YUB	0.25	\$125	\$31
22	Mar 7	Read /review & assess YUB second round of IRs	0.25	\$125	\$31
24	Mar 9-11	Read /review & assess YEC Responses to IRs	3	\$125	\$375
25	09-Mar	Read /review & assess YUB letter re: Ministers letter	0.25	\$125	\$31
23	Mar 10	Email response to YUB re: Ministers letter of 07/03/05	0.25	\$125	\$31
26	12-Mar	Read /review & assess YEC Responses to Direct Agreement IRs	0.75	\$125	\$94
27	12-Mar	Read /review & assess UCG Notice of Motion	0.25	\$125	\$31
28	13-Mar	Read /review & assess YECL's letter re: UCG Notice of Motion	0.15	\$125	\$19
29	13-Mar	Read /review & assess YEC letters from J Landry	0.4	\$125	\$50
30	13-Mar	hearing	0.1	\$125	\$13
31	14-Mar	Email to UCG (RR) re possible joint notice of motion by MB	0.25	\$125	\$31
32	15-Mar	Email from UCG (MB) re joint notice of motion	0.15	\$125	\$19
33	15-Mar	YUB memo to YEC & intervenors re: response to UCG Notice of Mo	0.1	\$125	\$13
34	15-Mar	Prepare support for UCG N of M and PWP Notice of Motion	0.5	\$125	\$63

35	16-Mar	YUB re PWP/ N of M, & YUB Order 2007-02	0.1	\$125	\$13		
36	19-Mar	YUB letter to Minister, YEC response to UCG, UCG to YUB	0.75	\$125	\$94		
37	20-Mar	Emails from: YEC (JL) & (SS) to UCG (RR & MB) review / assess	2	\$125	\$250		
38	21-Mar	UCG response to YEC re UCG NofM,	0.35	\$125	\$44		
39	22-Mar	Read /review / assess Ministers letter re: Part 3 hearing	0.45	\$125	\$56		
40	22-Mar	Prepare PWP/ response to YEC re: PWP NofM	0.5	\$125	\$63		
41	23-Mar	Email to UCG (RR & MB) re: possibly filing writs for oral hearing	0.75	\$125	\$94		
42	26-Mar	process, follow-up tele calls	0.4	\$125	\$50		
43	28-Mar	Read / review / assess YEC (JL) & UCG letters to YUB re Order 2007-03	0.75	\$125	\$94		
44	30-Mar	Conference with two other intervenors separately to discuss the appointment of new YUB member and organize argument strategies	1.25	\$125	\$156	78	0.55 \$41.80
45	Mar 30-Apr 1	Appointment of new YUB member, research, calls to G, McRobb & H, Macdonald, objection response to YUB and correction	6	\$125	\$750		LD phone call \$0.10
46	02-Apr	Read letters re new YUB appointment from UCG & YEC	0.15	\$125	\$19		
47	03-Apr	Read / review / assess YUB re PPA process without new member, Ministers letter directing Part 3 hearing	2.5	\$125	\$313		
48	04-Apr	Prepare PWP/ final arguments	6	\$125	\$750		
49	Apr 4-6	Read / review / assess final arguments of YEC, YEC/L & UCG	3	\$125	\$375		
50	09-Apr	Read/ review / assess YUB Order 2007-04 & appendix	0.5	\$125	\$63		
51	Apr 9-10	Prepare PWP rebuttal arguments	12	\$125	\$1,500		
52	Apr 12-15	Read / review / assess final reply arguments of YEC, YEC/L & UCG	3	\$125	\$375		
53	13-Apr	Read YUB membership appointment letter	0.1	\$125	\$13		
54	30-Apr	Read and assess YUB Order 2007-05 and reasons	1.5	\$125	\$188		
55	May 15-16	Attendance at Part #3 Hearing re PPA & Alshlik #3, confer with other intervenors, present oral arguments	8	\$125	\$1,000	152	0.55 \$83.80
56	May 29-31	Preparing this invoice from review of email files and diary entries	3	\$125	\$375		
57	June 01, 06		86.75		\$10,844		
58	- April 30,						
59	07	DISBURSEMENTS: copy paper @ \$0.10 per sheet	246	\$0	\$25		
60		DISBURSEMENTS: Telephone \$ 0.10					
61							
62		TOTAL INVOICED FEES = \$11,694.00					
63		TOTAL TRAVEL = \$ 167.20					
64		TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS = \$ 24.70					
65		GRAND TOTAL = \$11,885.90					

The above cost claim has been updated and corrected as requested by the YUB on June 21, 2007. The above cost claim hours are based upon a careful compilation of my email log records and my diary entries. As there was no hearing of the PPA Application, all of my invoiced time (in my opinion) is related to the formulation of argument and reply argument rather than for preparation for a hearing. However, the YUB may wish to reallocate the invoiced amounts as it sees fit. I had difficulty with the YUB's excel spread sheet template and therefore have submitted this most detailed cost summary. I confirm that, to the best of my knowledge and belief, the above hours claimed are a fair representation of the time I spent on this process. In fact, if anything, I have likely understated the time and efforts expended. Peter W. Percival, P. Eng.

PS: I do not, at this point, intend to submit a separate cost claim for the Part # 3 Hearing process except as included in the above detailed cost summary where, in my opinion, the Part # 3 hearing (and my attendance there at) related directly to the PPA and Alshlik # 3.